

# Reverse Auction RFP 2024-23 (09-17-2024) District Wide Camera System

Notes: Vendors will not be awarded solely based on price or evaluation percentage. Please refer to page [insert page number].			Vendor	Security Services Inc	TCSWARE Inc	Arkansas Public Safety	Cyber Technology Security	Nitor LLC	Bluebird
			Location	Cleveland, MS	Pearl, MS	Little Rock, AR	Senatobia, MS	Clemmons, NC	Alpharetta, GA
			Minority Code	N	N	N/A	W	N	N
	<b>Points</b>			Rhomus	Motorolas Services	Genetec	Verkada	Verkada SV11	
	<b>Points</b>		<b>Score</b>						
<b>Criteria</b>	10		10	10	10	10	10	10	9.29
1.1. High Resolution Camera System	10		10	10	10	10	10	10	9.38
1.2. Access Control System	10		10	10	10	10	9.33	10	10
1.3. Facial Recognition Technology	10		10	10	10	10	10	10	8
1.4 Intelligent Video Analytics	10		10	10	10	10	10	10	10
1.5. Integration with Video Management System (VMS)	5		5	5	5	5	5	5	5
1.6. Environmental Sensors	10		10	10	10	10	10	10	10
1.7. Customer Support	5		5	5	5	3.89	2.22	3.33	
1.8. Additional Features	10		10	10	10	10	10	10	10

Minority Code

N - Non Minority M - Minority W- Woman B - Woman Minority

# Reverse Auction RFP 2024-23 (09-17-2024) District Wide Camera System

1.9. Installation/Project Timeline	5			10	10	10	10	10	10
Previous Projects	15			-	-	-	-	-	-
<b>Percentage Total From Evaluations</b>				90.00%	90.00%	90.00%	88.89%	86.56%	84.99%
Comprehensive Security Upgrade as A Service – Monthly Cost Includes the total cost of the solution – All Equipment with Installation Cos				\$99,005.99	\$92,361.21	\$182,950.00	<b>No Bid</b>	\$85,000.00	\$191,816.00
Alternate Bid Item - JPSD Pays for the total cost of the solution – equipment and installation cost and labor. JPSD owns the equipment				\$5,000,000.00	\$5,202,551.00	<b>No Bid</b>	\$11,250,000.00	\$9,897,107.14	\$10,949,148.00
Alternate Bid Item – Accompanies Line Item 2 – Total Cost of the Service as described monthly for a period of five years.				\$9,500.00	\$34,124.16	<b>No Bid</b>	\$40,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$10,511.00
Annual Cost over 12 months				\$114,000.00	\$409,489.92	-	\$480,000.00	\$120,000.00	\$126,132.00
<b>Bid Calculations (below)</b>				<b>Security Services Inc</b>	<b>TCSWARE Inc</b>	<b>Arkansas Public Safety</b>	<b>Cyber Technology Security</b>	<b>Nitor LLC</b>	<b>Bluebird</b>
Line Item 1 - Paying Monthly for Hardware and Services - 60 Month Term				\$5,940,359.40	\$5,541,672.60	\$10,977,000.00	<b>No Bid</b>	\$5,100,000.00	\$11,508,960.00
Line Items 2 and 3 - Hardware + Service - JPS Owns Hardware, Receives Service				\$5,570,000.00	\$7,250,000.60	<b>No Bid</b>	\$13,650,000.00	\$10,497,107.14	\$11,579,808.00

Minority Code

N - Non Minority M - Minority W- Woman B - Woman Minority